AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

115TH CONGRESS
L™ HL,R. 414

To amend the Higher Education Act of 1965 to allow an individual to
qualify for both teacher loan forgiveness and public service loan forgive-
ness, and for other purposes.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

JANUARY 10, 2017
Mrs. LAWRENCE introduced the following bill; which was referred to the
Committee on Education and the Workforee

A BILL

To amend the Higher Education Act of 1965 to allow an
individual to qualify for both teacher loan forgiveness
and public service loan forgiveness, and for other pur-
poses.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Encourage our Edu-
cators Act’’.

SEC. 2. LOAN FORGIVENESS FOR TEACHERS.

(a) PART B.—Section 428J of the Higher Education

o B =) T V) B SN UV I \ O]

Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C. 1078-10) 1s amended—



O o0 N N W Bk W =

O TN NG I N T NG N NG I NG R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ T N U N N = = N Re - BN B e ) W ) B ~S O B NO S e

2
(1) in subsection (b)(1), in the matter pre-
ceding subparagraph (A), by striking “5” and in-
serting “3";
(2) 1 subsection (¢)—
(A) in paragraph (1)—
(1) by striking “$5,000” and inserting
“$17,500”; and
(i1) by striking “fifth” and inserting
“third”’; and
(B) by striking paragraph (3); and
(3) in subsection (2)—
(A) by inserting “or’” at the end of sub-
paragraph (A); and
(B) by striking subparagraph (B).
(b) PART D.—Section 460 of the Higher Education

of 1965 (20 U.S.C. 1087j) is amended—

(1) in subsection (b)(1), in the matter pre-
ceding subparagraph (A), by striking “5” and in-
serting “3"’;

(2) in subsection (¢)—

(A) in paragraph (1)—

(1) by striking “$5,000” and inserting
“$17,500”; and

(ii) by striking “fifth” and inserting

“third”’; and

*HR 414 IH



O o0 N N W Bk W =

[ w—
e

Q
(3}

(B) by striking paragraph (3); and
(3) in subsection (2)—
(A) by inserting “or’” at the end of sub-
paragraph (A); and
(B) by striking subparagraph (B).
SEC. 3. CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.
Section 455(m)(4) of the Higher Education Act of
1965 (20 U.S.C. 1087¢(m)(4)) 1s amended—
(1) by striking “428.J,”; and
(2) by striking “4281, or 460” and inserting *,
or 4281.7.

*HR 414 IH



