AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

II

Calendar No. 520

[Report No. 117-174]

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

March 16, 2022
Received; read twice and referred to the Committee on Energy and Natural
Resources
SEPTEMBER 28, 2022
Reported by Mr. MANCHIN, without amendment

AN ACT

To authorize the Secretary of the Interior to continue to
implement endangered fish recovery programs for the
Upper Colorado and San Juan River Basins, and for
other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Upper Colorado and

Y B S S B O]

San Juan River Basins Recovery Act”.



2

1 SEC. 2. EXTENSION OF AUTHORIZATIONS RELATED TO FISH

2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14

RECOVERY PROGRAMS.

Section 3 of Public Law 106-392 (114 Stat. 1603

et seq.) 1s amended—

(1) by striking “2023” each place it appears
and inserting 2024”7,

(2) in  subsection (b)(1), by striking
“$179,000,000” and inserting “$184,000,000’;

(3) in  subsection (b)(2) by striking
“$30,000,000” and inserting “$25,000,000”;

(43

(4) in subsection (h), by striking *, at least 1
year prior to such expiration,”; and
(5) in subsection (j), by striking “2021" each

place it appears and inserting “2022".

*HR 5001 RS






Calendar No. 520

11710 CONGRESS
»sson - Ho R 9001

[Report No. 117-174]

AN ACT

To authorize the Secretary of the Interior to con-
tinue to implement endangered fish recovery pro-
grams for the Upper Colorado and San Juan
River Basins, and for other purposes.

SEPTEMBER 28, 2022

Reported without amendment



